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4. ISSUING OFFICE
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NAME AND TITLE OF CERTIFYING OFFICIAL (TYPE)

Thomas McKay

ontlactmz Ofﬁce1

offers received in response to this SIGNATURE (/l DATE BIGNE
solicitation. q [ g
5 PROJECT TITLE 8. GOVERNMENT ESTIMATE 9 _OFFERS [ }
{Check A, B or C and complete D, E, and F} NG, 1
FY08 NOAA Gauge Houses at Menominee, [ | A HRED LABOR A. OFFEROR: Roen Salvage | A. Alfredson Brothers Construction
Holland & Algonac Harbors Ml Company Company
B. BID SECURITY (Type and B. BID SECURITY (Type and amount) -
X | B ooy et [ lamouny  20% 20%
6. NUMBER OF AMENDMENTS ISSUED T — C. AMENDMENTS A. AMENDMENTS ACKNOWLEDGED
2 : (Including Profi ACKNOWLEDGED 2 2
7A. SOEaT D. | E UNIT | F. ESTIMATED D. UNIT | E. ESTIVATED D. UNIT E. ESTIMATED
TEM 7B. DESCRIPTION OF OFFERED | quanmiTy | UNIT | PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT
NO. ITEM
0001 Schedule | — Menominee
NOAA Gauge House
0001AA. | Shte Freparation 1 LS $ 93.421.00 $ 32,300.00 $ 14,635.12
GifiAn || ek P st 1 LS $ 16,981.00 $ 44,000.00 $ 22,807.99
0001ac | St Wel 1 Ls $ 43,370.00 $ 64,000.00 $ 15,902.23
oooiAp | Gauge House 1 LS $ 68,103.00 $ 94,000.00 $ 65,002.76
0001AE | Stee! Sheet Pile Construction 1 LS $140,121.00 $185,000.00 $237,266.40
Total Amount of Bid for
Mori6irinee -Gt ge-Hoxiss $361,996.00 $419,300.00 $355,614.50
0002 Schedule Il — Holland Harbor
ooozaa | Stte Preparation 1 LS $113,849.00 No Bid No Bid
aoo2as | 'ntake Pipe Installation 1 LS $ 23.918.00 No Bid No Bid
0002ac | Still Well 1 LS $ 43,251.00 No Bid No Bid
0002AD | Gauge House 1 LS $115,770.00 No Bid No Bid
0002AE Steel Sheet Pile Construction 1 LS $179.954.00 No Bid No Bid
Total Amount of Bid for . ;
Holland Gauge House $476,742.00 Nebid NexBig




1. SOLICITATION NUMBER 3. DATE 3. DATE OPENED PAGE OF
ABSTRACT OF OFFERS - s |t )

CONSTRUCTION WITIXKSB0024  |pias PAGES 4
4. ISSUING OFFICE NAME AND TITLE OF CERTIFYING OFFICIAL (TYPE)
US Army Engineering District, Detroit Thomas McKay
Contractmg Otﬁcel
offers received in response to this SIGNATURE DAT SlG
solicitation. ' O‘?
5. PROJECT TITLE 8. GOVERNMENT ESTIMATE 9. OFFERS.
(Check A, B or C and complete D, E, and F) NO. 1 NG, 2
FY08 NOAA Gauge Houses at Menominee, E A. HIRED LABOR B. OFFEROR: Roen Salvage | A OFFEROR: Alfredson Brothers Construction
Holland & Algonac Harbors MI Company Company
B. BID SECURITY (Type and B. BID SECURITY (Type and amount)
X | B Reat bty O TRACT | amount)  20% 20%
6. NUMBER OF AMENDMENTS ISSUED & AR R CORSET C. AMENDMENTS B. AMENDMENTS ACKNOWLEDGED
2 . {Including Profit} REhNOWL EDLED 2 2
TA. 7C. EST D. E. UNIT F. ESTIMATED | D. UNIT F. ESTIMATED | D. UNIT E. ESTIMATED
ITEM 7B. DESCRIPTION OF OFFERED QUANTITY | UNIT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT
NO. ITEM
0003 Algonac - Option
Algonac Site Preparation — . .
0003AA Option 1 1 LS $ 55,205.00 No Bid No Bid
0003Ag | Intake Pipe Installation 0 1 LS $ 60,579.00 No Bid No Bid
Option 1
ooosac | Stll Well=Option 1 1 Ls $ 48,961.00 No.Bid No Bid
G H — Option 1 i .
ooasap: | GevesHouse~ Option 1 LS $ 50,420.00 ARk No Bid
Total Amount of Bid : 2
Algonac $215,165.00 No Bid No Bid
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INSTRUCTIONS - Attach this form to OF 1419, Abstract of Offers - Construction, when more than 2 offers are received on a construction project. Each
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2, PROJECT TITLE

FY08 NOAA Gauge Houses at Menominee,
Holland & Algonac Harbors Ml

4. OFFERS (Continued)

NO.:_3

NO.: 4

NO.:5

NO.: 6

A. OFFEROR: Meridian
Contracting Services LLC

E. OFFEROR:

A. OFFEROR:

B. BID SECURITY (Type and Amount)

F. BID SECURITY (Type and Amount)

B. BID SECURITY (Type and Amount)

B. BID SECURITY (Type and Amount) ) 0,
20% 20% 20% 20%
C.AMENDMENTS ACKNOWLEDGED |C. AMENDMENTS ACKNOWLEDGED  |C. AMENDMENTS ACKNOWLEDGED C. AMENDMENTS ACKNOWLEDGED
3. CONTRACT ITEMS 9 2 P 3
A. B. C. E. UNIT E. ESTIMATED | D. UNIT E. ESTIMATED D. UNIT E. ESTIMATED D. UNIT E. ESTIMATED
ITEM ESTIMATED UNIT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT
NO. QUANTITY
1 Schedule | — Menominee
000 NOAA Gauge House
0001AA | Site Preparation 1 $ 50,027.00
tak i i

0001AB Intake Pipe Installation 1 $ 16,852.00
0001ac | Stil Well 1 $ 87,901.00
0001ap | Gauge House 1 $ 83,060.00

Steel Sheet Pile
0001AE Construction 1 $257,369.00

Total Amount of Bid for

Menominee Harbor $495,209.00

Schedule Il — Holland
0002 Harbor

e p -

gopzs | PeErepamtion 1 $234,654.00

Int i i
0002AB ntake Pipe Installation 1 $ 22.186.00
0002AC iAWl 1 $121,123.00
0002ap | Gauge House 1 $ 98,780.00

Steel Sheet Pile
0002AE Canstiiclion 1 $317,779.00

Total Amount of Bid for

Holland Harbor $794,522.00
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INSTRUCTIONS - Attach this form to OF 1418, Abstract of Offers - Construction, when more than 2 offers are received on a construction project. Each
Continuation Sheet will accommodate 14 contract items to conform to the number of items which can be entered on the OF 1419. Use additional OF 1419's for
contract items in excess of 14 and attach additional Continuation Sheets (OF 14184) as needed.

2. PROJECTTITLE

FY08 NOAA Gauge Houses at Menominee,
Holland & Algonac Harbors MI

4. OFFERS (Continued)

NO.:_3

NO.: 4

NO.:5

NO.: 6

A. OFFEROR: Meridian
Contracting Services LLC

G. OFFEROR:

A, OFFEROR:

B. BID SECURITY (Type and Amount)

B. BID SECURITY (Type and Amount)

H. BID SECURITY (Type and Amount)

B. BID SECURITY (Type and Amount)

0 0
20% 20% 20% 20%
C.AMENDMENTS C. AMENDMENTS ACKNOWLEDGED C. AMENDMENTS ACKNOWLEDGED [C. AMENDMENTS ACKNOWLEDGED
A, B. C. E. UNIT E. ESTIMATED | D. UNIT E. ESTIMATED D. UNIT E. ESTIMATED D. UNIT E. ESTIMATED
ITEM ESTIMATED UNIT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT
NO. QUANTITY
0003 Algonac - Option
Algonac Site Preparation
0003AA — Option 1 1 $221,407.00
Intake Pipe Installation 0
0003AB Option 1 1 $ 21,535.00
ogoaAc | St Well=Option:1 1 $137,842.00
0003AD | ®2uge House - Option 1 1 $ 67,918.00
Total Amount of Bid
Algonac $448,702.00




